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 Last Sunday: The theory
• We need to be fully realistic
• Only God can make us see the spiritual reality



Matthew 6:24-34  No man can serve two masters: for either he will hate the one, and love the 
other; or else he will hold to the one, and despise the other. You cannot serve God and 
mammon. Therefore I say unto you, Take no thought for your life, what you shall eat, or what 
you shall drink; nor yet for your body, what you shall put on. Is not the life more than food, and 
the body than clothing? Behold the fowls of the air: for they sow not, neither do they reap, nor 
gather into barns; yet your heavenly Father feeds them. Are you not much better than they? 
Which of you by taking thought can add one cubit unto his stature? And why take you thought 
for clothing? Consider the lilies of the field, how they grow; they toil not, neither do they spin: 
And yet I say unto you, That even Solomon in all his glory was not arrayed like one of these. 



Therefore, if God so clothe the grass of the field, which today is, and tomorrow is cast into the 
oven, shall he not much more clothe you, O you of little faith? Therefore take no thought, 
saying, What shall we eat? or, What shall we drink? or, How shall we be clothed? (For after all 
these things do the Gentiles seek:) for your heavenly Father knows that you have need of all 
these things. But seek you first the kingdom of God, and his righteousness; and all these things 
shall be added unto you. Take therefore no thought for tomorrow: for tomorrow shall take 
thought of the things for itself. Sufficient unto the day is the evil thereof. 



Matthew 6:24 No man can serve two masters: for either he will hate the one, and love the 
other; or else he will hold to the one, and despise the other. You cannot serve God and 
mammon. 



Mark 10:17-21 And when he was gone forth into the way, there came one running, and kneeled 
to him, and asked him, Good Teacher, what shall I do that I may inherit eternal life? And Jesus 
said unto him, Why call me good? there is none good but one, that is, God. You know the 
commandments, Do not commit adultery, Do not kill, Do not steal, Do not bear false witness, 
Defraud not, Honor your father and mother. And he answered and said unto him, Teacher, all 
these have I observed from my youth. Then Jesus beholding him loved him, and said unto him, 
One thing you lack: go your way, sell whatsoever you have, and give to the poor, and you shall 
have treasure in heaven: and come, take up the cross, and follow me. 



Matthew 6:25 Therefore I say unto you, Take no thought for your life, what you shall eat, or 
what you shall drink; nor yet for your body, what you shall put on. Is not the life more than food, 
and the body than clothing? 



Matthew 6:26-27 Behold the fowls of the air: for they sow not, neither do they reap, nor gather 
into barns; yet your heavenly Father feeds them. Are you not much better than they? Which of 
you by taking thought can add one cubit unto his stature? 



Matthew 6:28-30 And why take you thought for clothing? Consider the lilies of the field, how 
they grow; they toil not, neither do they spin: And yet I say unto you, That even Solomon in all 
his glory was not arrayed like one of these. Therefore, if God so clothe the grass of the field, 
which today is, and tomorrow is cast into the oven, shall he not much more clothe you, O you of 
little faith? 



Matthew 6:31-32 Therefore take no thought, saying, What shall we eat? or, What shall we 
drink? or, How shall we be clothed? (For after all these things do the Gentiles seek:) for your 
heavenly Father knows that you have need of all these things. 



 Seek

Matthew 6:33 But seek you first the kingdom of God, and his righteousness; and all these things 
shall be added unto you. 



 God’s Kingdom

Matthew 6:33 But seek you first the kingdom of God, and his righteousness; and all these things 
shall be added unto you. 



 Righteousness

Matthew 6:33 But seek you first the kingdom of God, and his righteousness; and all these things 
shall be added unto you. 



 Result

Matthew 6:33 But seek you first the kingdom of God, and his righteousness; and all these things 
shall be added unto you. 



 Jesus offers us a different way of receiving the things we need

Matthew 6:33 But seek you first the kingdom of God, and his righteousness; and all these things 
shall be added unto you. 



Matthew 6:34 Take therefore no thought for tomorrow: for tomorrow shall take thought of the 
things for itself. Sufficient unto the day is the evil thereof. 



 Knowing God’s Word

 Seeking Spiritual Reality



 No seeking God’s kingdom and righteousness -> no seeing spiritual realities

Matthew 11:28 Come unto me, all you that labor and are heavy laden, and I will give you rest.



Matthew 6:33 But seek you first the kingdom of God, and his righteousness; and all these things 
shall be added unto you. 


